From: Celeste Center

To: Jason Brown; Dylan Reingold; helenec@indianrivered.com; Kristin Daniels; Kathy Charest; Phil Matson; Susan
Adams; Peter D. O"Bryan; Laura Moss; Joseph E. Flescher; Joe Earman; Tina Cournoyer; BCC - Board Members

Subject: Re: Confirming Piano Entertainment for St. Patrick"s Day, Tue., Mar. 17 at 4:30-6:30 pm

Date: Thursday, March 31, 2022 6:31:27 PM

CAUTION: This message is from an external source. Please use caution when opening attachments or clicking links.

From: Celeste Center <celestecan@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, March 11, 2022 2:05 PM

To: Jason Brown <jbrown@ircgov.com>; Dylan Reingold <dreingold@ircgov.com>;
helenec@indianrivered.com <helenec@indianrivered.com>; Kristin Daniels <kdaniels@ircgov.com>;
Kathy Charest <kcharest@ircgov.com>; Phil Matson <pmatson@ircgov.com>

Subject: Re: Confirming Piano Entertainment for St. Patrick's Day, Tue., Mar. 17 at 4:30-6:30 pm

They called to cancel, so unfortunately, | don't have an email showing the cancellation, but
this show was cancelled because the venue (Green Turtle Cove) shut down due to COVID. All
shows scheduled for 2020 were cancelled, not just one or two. And | had more business
scheduled for 2020 than | had in 2019 because | was building back my business from the
horrible crimes committed against me in 2014-7. Please discard your false belief and look at
the facts and evidence. Thanks.

From: Mark Bealhen <Catalina2 @charter.net>

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 2:02 PM

To: Celeste Center <celestecan@hotmail.com>

Subject: Re: Confirming Piano Entertainment for St. Patrick's Day, Tue., Mar. 17 at 4:30-6:30 pm

I will be down by the pool at 5:30

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 25, 2020, at 4:38 PM, Celeste Center <celestecan@hotmail.com> wrote:

Great! | can be there at about 5:30. | cannot call, but | can send you an email
that I am on my way.

Would you like me to correct the contract?

From: catalina2 @charter.net <catalina2 @charter.net>
Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 12:05 PM
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To: 'Celeste Center' <celestecan@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: Confirming Piano Entertainment for St. Patrick's Day, Tue., Mar. 17 at 4:30-
6:30 pm

Yes

Please do call my cell when you get in the parking area by the pool house | will walk up
| noticed you stated Hutchinson Island Resort on the contract we are across the street
from them

3792 NE Ocean Blvd

Green Turtle Cove

Cell number 414-406-2603

Thank you

From: Celeste Center <celestecan@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 2:40 PM

To: catalina2 @charter.net

Subject: Re: Confirming Piano Entertainment for St. Patrick's Day, Tue., Mar. 17 at 4:30-
6:30 pm

| am playing a Mardi Gras show today in Jensen Beach. | would like to stop by and
see the venue for St. Patrick's Day, since | am in the area. Can | stop by at about 6
pm today? Sorry for the short notice.

| can also pick up the check for the deposit, if you have it. Save a stamp.

Happy Mardi Gras!

From: Celeste Center <celestecan@hotmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, February 22, 2020 12:50 PM

To: catalina? @charter.net <catalina2 @charter.net>
Subject: Confirming Piano Entertainment for St. Patrick's Day, Tue., Mar. 17 at 4:30-
6:30 pm

Yes, confirming 4:30-6:30 pm. Please find contract and invoice attached. Please
make check payable to Deborah Cooney and mail to:

Deborah Cooney
P O Box 70013
Wabasso, FL 32970

Thanks!
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From: catalina?2 @charter.net <catalina2 @charter.net>
Sent: Friday, February 21, 2020 2:47 PM

To: 'celestecan@hotmail.com' <celestecan@hotmail.com>
Subject: Fwd: Confirming Piano Entertainment for St. Patrick's Day, Tue., Mar. 17 at 4-6
pm

| will be glad to send out a check for $200 tomorrow if you could please forward me a
mailing address for you.

Also | have had a request from some of our entertainment people to ask if we could
have the music from 4:30 to 6:30

Instead to the 4 to 6 time | firsts requested, that would give late arrivals a chance to be
full participants.

If you could get a simple stated contract sent out | can keep a file for future events..

Thank you
Mark

From: Celeste Center <celestecan@hotmail.com>

Date: February 19, 2020 at 3:29:58 PM EST

To: "catalinal @charter.net" <catalinal @charter.net>
Subject: Confirming Piano Entertainment for St. Patrick's Day, Tue.,
Mar. 17 at 4-6 pm

Dear Mark,

| am confirming piano entertainment for St. Patrick's Day, Tue., Mar.
17 at 4-6 pm. | can arrive at 3:30 to set up the keyboard. Could you
please pay 50% ($200) at your earliest convenience (check or Zelle).
The remaining 50% ($200) can be paid at the show. Would you like
me to prepare a contract or invoice?

| am looking forward to the party!

Thanks,
Celeste
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